
CITY OF BATAVIA
100 N. Island Avenue, Batavia, IL  60510

(630) 454-2000   http://cityofbatavia.net

Committee of the Whole Agenda
Tuesday, February 23, 2016

7:30 PM  Council Chambers 1st Floor

Roll Call

Approve Minutes For February 9, 2016

COW 16-02-09M.DOC

Items Removed/Added/Changed

Matters From The Public (For Items NOT On Agenda)

Ordinance 16-11: A Variance For A Detached Garage – Spillane & Sons Inc., Applicant 514 
Main Street (DMR 2/15/16) CD

ORD16-11-514MAIN-VARIANCE-020416.PDF

Ordinance 16-13: Update To 2015 Property Maintenance Code (JSA 2/15/16) CS

ORD 16-13 2015 IPMC PACKET-- FINAL.PDF

Resolution 16-06-R: Authorization To Purchase One 2016 International 7400 4x2 Dump 
Truck Chassis From Rush Truck Centers For $75,992.00 (Scott Haines 2/16/16) CS

RES. 16-06-R MEMO 2016 I7400 TRUCK RUSH.DOC.PDF

Resolution 16-23-R: Authorization To Purchase Truck Equipment From Monroe 
TruckEquipment For $63,064.00 (Scott Haines 2/16/16) CS

RES. 16-23-R MEMO TRUCK EQUIP. MONROE.DOC.PDF

Resolution 16-22-R: Authorization To Purchase Truck Equipment From Henderson 
TruckEquipment For $42,300.00 (Scott Haines 2/3/16) CS

RES. 16-22-R MEMO TRUCK EQUIP. HENDERSON.DOC.PDF

Discussion: Homes For Changing Region Community Land Trust (Scott Buening 1/26/16) 
CD

COMMUNITY LAND TRUST COMBINED REP.PDF

Discussion: Continued Discussion Regarding Sidewalk Requirements (SCB 2/12/16) CD

SIDEWALKCOMBINEDMEM2016-2.PDF

Fox River Issues CD

Community Boundary Signage (WRM 2/15/16) GS

16-02-15 BOUNDARY SIGNAGE.PDF

Project Status

Other

Closed Session:
  a. Purchase and Sale of Electric Power

  b. Property Acquisition -addition (WRM) 

Adjournment

1.

2.

Documents:

3.

4.

5.

Documents:

6.

Documents:

7.

Documents:

8.

Documents:

9.

Documents:

10.

Documents:

11.

Documents:

12.

13.

Documents:

14.

15.

16.

17.

http://cityofbatavia.net/


CITY OF BATAVIA
100 N. Island Avenue, Batavia, IL  60510

(630) 454-2000   http://cityofbatavia.net

Committee of the Whole Agenda
Tuesday, February 23, 2016

7:30 PM  Council Chambers 1st Floor

Roll Call

Approve Minutes For February 9, 2016

COW 16-02-09M.DOC

Items Removed/Added/Changed

Matters From The Public (For Items NOT On Agenda)

Ordinance 16-11: A Variance For A Detached Garage – Spillane & Sons Inc., Applicant 514 
Main Street (DMR 2/15/16) CD

ORD16-11-514MAIN-VARIANCE-020416.PDF

Ordinance 16-13: Update To 2015 Property Maintenance Code (JSA 2/15/16) CS

ORD 16-13 2015 IPMC PACKET-- FINAL.PDF

Resolution 16-06-R: Authorization To Purchase One 2016 International 7400 4x2 Dump 
Truck Chassis From Rush Truck Centers For $75,992.00 (Scott Haines 2/16/16) CS

RES. 16-06-R MEMO 2016 I7400 TRUCK RUSH.DOC.PDF

Resolution 16-23-R: Authorization To Purchase Truck Equipment From Monroe 
TruckEquipment For $63,064.00 (Scott Haines 2/16/16) CS

RES. 16-23-R MEMO TRUCK EQUIP. MONROE.DOC.PDF

Resolution 16-22-R: Authorization To Purchase Truck Equipment From Henderson 
TruckEquipment For $42,300.00 (Scott Haines 2/3/16) CS

RES. 16-22-R MEMO TRUCK EQUIP. HENDERSON.DOC.PDF

Discussion: Homes For Changing Region Community Land Trust (Scott Buening 1/26/16) 
CD

COMMUNITY LAND TRUST COMBINED REP.PDF

Discussion: Continued Discussion Regarding Sidewalk Requirements (SCB 2/12/16) CD

SIDEWALKCOMBINEDMEM2016-2.PDF

Fox River Issues CD

Community Boundary Signage (WRM 2/15/16) GS

16-02-15 BOUNDARY SIGNAGE.PDF

Project Status

Other

Closed Session:
  a. Purchase and Sale of Electric Power

  b. Property Acquisition -addition (WRM) 

Adjournment

1.

2.

Documents:

3.

4.

5.

Documents:

6.

Documents:

7.

Documents:

8.

Documents:

9.

Documents:

10.

Documents:

11.

Documents:

12.

13.

Documents:

14.

15.

16.

17.

http://il-batavia.civicplus.com/bbfde8a2-5855-4efa-8756-554f3b87c79a


 MINUTES
February 9, 2016

Committee of the Whole
City of Batavia

Please NOTE: These minutes are not a word-for-word transcription of the statements made at the 
meeting, nor intended to be a comprehensive review of all discussions. They are intended to make an 
official record of the actions taken by the Committee/City Council, and to include some description of 
discussion points as understood by the minute-taker. They may not reference some of the individual 
attendee’s comments, nor the complete comments if referenced.

Chair Brown called the meeting to order at 7:30pm.

1. Roll Call

Members Present: Ald.  Brown ,  Russotto, Atac, Stark ,  Wolff,  Fischer, O’Brien, Callahan, 
Hohmann, Mueller, Botterman, Cerone, and McFadden

Members Absent: Ald. Chanzit

Also Present: Mayor Schielke ;  Bill McGrath, City Administrator;  Gary Holm, 
Director of Public Works;  Wendy Bednarek, HR Director; Howard 
Chason, Information Systems Director;  Glen Autenrieth, Batavia 
Police Department; and Jennifer Austin-Smith, Recording Secretary

2. Items to be Removed/Added/Changed
Brown stated that  agenda item number nine, “Renewing Community Digital Sign Initiative and 
Kane Count y Riverboat Grant Application,” would be removed.  There was no objection from the 
Committee. 

3. Matters From The Public (For Items NOT on Agenda)
There were no matters from the public for items not on the agenda at this time.

4. Review City Administrator Recruitment Profile – WRB LLC (Wendy Bednarek 
2/9/16)

A summary was distributed to the Committee along with the brochure.  Adriane Johnson, WRB 
LLC, reported on the changes to the City Administrator recruitment profile  per the Committee’s 
direction .  She explained that they  would  be concluding Phase 1, the engagement session, of the 
process and entering into Phase 2, recruitment of the City Administrator. 

Hohmann asked who from staff would be on the  interview  panel. Johnson stated that she believes 
it would be the HR Director and another staff member, which is yet to be decided. McGrath 
suggested that the department heads not be broken up as a grou p. To have only  one of  the 
department heads  singled out for interviews  (besides HR)  would be inappropriate. Johnson stated 
that the screening team is different from the department head interview team and referenced page 
eleven on the brochure for the COW to review.

Johnson explained the recruitment process with the Committee and noted that a memo would be 
distributed with the status on the recruitment process at the end of March. The candidates would 



Committee of the Whole
February 2, 2016
Page 2

be presented to the Mayor and the COW and should be on track to  have  a new City 
Administrator under contract by June 1st.

5. Resolution 16-14 -R:  Authorizing a Representative to Sign Loan Documents (WRM 
2/5/16) GS

Atac  reported   that this resolution is to authorize the Finance Director, Peggy Colby, to sign the 
loan documents. In the past, only the City Administrator was able to sign the loan documents. 
Atac explained that Colby would not be able to sign anything that obligates the City to borrow 
money but could sign for the application process.

Motion: To recommend approval of  Resolution 16-14-R: Authorizing a Representative to 
Sign Loan Documents

Maker: Atac
Second: Cerone
Voice Vote: 13 Ayes, 0 Nays, 1 Absent

Motion carried.
CONSENT AGENDA

6. Approval :  6 th  Amendment to TriCom Intergovernmental Agreement (Chief Schira 
1/28/16) GS

Stark  announced that she is the representative for TriCom from the City Council. She explained 
that as  TriCom has  taken on additional towns, the newer members have wanted voting rights. We 
had to amend the Intergovernmental Agreement to allow for a certain amount of voting rights to 
the newer members.  Stark explained that the newer members  do not get to sit on the board but 
they will have some voting rights in TriCom. Stark stated that it is important that this gets done 
now to make it clear that Batavia, Geneva and St. Charles are the primary members of Tri-Com.

Motion: To recommend approval of  6 th  Amendment to TriCom Intergovernmental 
Agreement

Maker: Stark
Second: McFadden
Voice Vote: 13 Ayes, 0 Nays, 1 Absent

Motion carried.

7. Resolution 16-12 -R:  Authorizing Execution of the Local Agency Agreement for 
Federal Participation for the Wilson Street LAFO Resurfacing-Raddant Road to Kirk 
Road Project with the Illinois Department of Transportation (Tim Grimm 2/4/16) CS

Holm  reported that  the City has  received federal funding from the Kane Kendall Council of 
Mayors. The funding would allow us to resurface from Raddant Road to Kirk Road. Two 
agreements need to be executed to receive the federal funding. The f i rst one is Resolution 16-12- 
R and o ur portion of the project cost would be $126,500 and if the costs come in below that then 
our portion would proportionately be below. If the project costs come above that then we would 
pay whatever the addition is. 

Motion: To recommend approval of  Resolution 16-12-R: Authorizing Execution of the 
Local Agency Agreement for Federal Participation for the Wilson Street LAFO 



Committee of the Whole
February 2, 2016
Page 3

Resurfacing-Raddant Road to Kirk Road Project with the Illinois Department of 
Transportation

Maker: O’Brien
Second: Hohmann
Voice Vote: 13 Ayes, 0 Nays, 1 Absent

Motion carried.
CONSENT AGENDA

8. Resolution 16-13 -R:  Authorizing Execution of the Construction Engineering Services 
Agrement for Federal Participation for the Wilson Street LAFO Resurfacing – 
Raddant Road to Kirk Road with AECOM (Tim Grimm 2/4/16) CS

Holm  reported that AECOM has extensive experience in LAFO, which is why they were chosen, 
and they have provided the City with a scope of cost of service for $42,909. AECOM would 
provide professional services for Phase 3 construction. The cost is contained within the City’s 
participation of the cost of $126,500 as discussed in the agenda item prior. 

Motion: To recommend approval of  Resolution 16-13-R: Authorizing Execution of the 
Construction Engineering Services Agre e ment for Federal Participation for the 
Wilson Street LAFO Resurfacing – Raddant Road to Kirk Road with AECOM

Maker: O’Brien
Second: Stark
Voice Vote: 13 Ayes, 0 Nays, 1 Absent

Motion carried.
CONSENT AGENDA

9. Renewing Community Digital Sign Initiative and Kane County Riverboat Grant 
Application (Chris Aiston 2/5/16)

This discussion was removed from the agenda.

10. Discussion: Communication Person (WRM 2/5/16) GS
McGrath  stated that he sent out a memo to the Committee regarding the Communication 
position. He explained that he has heard from several COW members that it is time to hire a 
Communications person and do a budget amendment to hire someone for this task. McGrath 
stated that he has this on the agenda for discussion.

Wolff stated that there is a need for a communications person. He noted that the school district 
now has a full time person doing communications and it has been a step in the right direction. 
Fischer stated that this is an important position and he would be in favor of hiring someone for 
this.  Mayor Schielke stated that this is a common position being looked at for several 
municipalities. The question is the role of this person in regards to social media. Mayor Schielke 
stated that we need to have a policy on this so that there is direction. Brown commented that we 
are talking about hiring someone for a position that we do not have a job description for.  We 
need to know more information on this position. Brown stated that he is not against the position 
but he is not sure what the position consists of. Brown stated that the new City Administrator 
may have some good ideas on this and should have the ability to make a recommendation for this 



Committee of the Whole
February 2, 2016
Page 4

position. McGrath stated that he distributed a job description on this and will resend it to the 
Committee. 

Brown stated that we were going to have a discussion on all of the positions needed within the 
City. Cerone agreed. Mueller stated that she would like to look at this position within the group 
of staffing needs so that we could prioritize them. She would like to see all the priorities first 
before we make a decision. Stark stated that we should look at these things sooner than the 
second half of the year so that we could get this done. Callahan stated that he is in support of 
hiring a communications person. He stated that we should talk about this more next month and 
consider where this position lays within the staffing priorities. At budget time, we voted on this 
and stated that  this  position could wait until next fall. We should talk about this next month in 
the bigger picture. Callahan added that policy decisions should be made prior to hiring someone 
for this position. Botterman supported having discussion on all staffing needs. Hohmann 
concurred. McFadden stated that the COW should have this discussion in context.

Brown stated that  the Committee  want s  to have a good discussion on personnel so that we could 
prioritize the hiring and have discussion on how we could find revenue. Brown stated that the 
COW would like to have discussion on the status on projects as well. 

McGrath stated that  the COW  need s  a retreat to discuss where the priorities are.  Afterwards,  you 
have the department heads  work on any work needed and then  the COW could  start working on 
the budget process. Brown stated that he could support a retreat for that purpose.  Atac  
commented that she  would like to consider the strategic plan an d take a global approach to it . 
She feels that the  list of priorities is  micromanaging the staff. We should hand the strategic plan 
to staff and then have staff make the list of priorities. 

McGrath will bring some more materials for the March meeting and suggest a  retreat in August 
when the new administrator is here.

11. Fox River Issues CD
McGrath reported  on the past two memos sent to the Committee. He stated that  the owners  of the 
strip center  are very open to working with  City staff . The next step would be finishing the RFQ 
and bringing in engineers.  He is still waiting on feedback from the Park District on what role 
they would like to play on the dam and the depot pond. McGrath will send out a PowerP oint on 
what St. Charles  is  working on and it might be something Council might want to do on how to 
approach it because it is a big project. 

12. Project Status
Bill reported on the following:

 Staff is visiting  Chapman and Cutler regarding the bonding and  how it  impacts   the 
project that we are working on at the Baptist Church. An issues memo has been sent to 
Chapman and Cutler from  City Attorney  Drendel and Aiston.  We should have a good 
idea on whether there are certain things we could do. 

 Staff will be  also be  m eeting with  the City’s  bond advisors  as part of the C & C meeting. 
We should have some key information by the end of the week.



Committee of the Whole
February 2, 2016
Page 5

 Staff is working on l and acquisition  this week. Staff should  know more in the next couple 
of weeks.

 Staff will  internally  take  a look at the zoning ordinance and some of the building code s  to 
see if things are too complex and review for business friendliness. 

 Holm has been in touch with legal counsel downtown, there is nothing to report as of yet. 
Electronic and paper documentation has been sent to our legal counsel.

 Holm is going down to Prairie State for meetings for the next couple of days.

 Staff n eed s  more information on the  digital  sign  initiative and is working on obtaining the 
information needed.

 Gary  Holm  and Wendy  Bednarek  have interviews  on Monday  with the top two 
candidates for the  Electric  Financial  M anager position. H e h ope s  to have more 
information next week on how that went. 

Botterman asked about the prevailing wage component.  McGrath stated that prevailing wage is 
determined project by project. T he legislature changes the definition of what public works  are 
and the factors  to pay for prevailing wage. The  main  factor is when public funds  are  used to pay 
someone else to do work.  McGrath noted that the City’s legal counsel consistently reviews the 
prevailing wage laws.

13. Other
Callahan announced that Thursday night in the City Council Chamber, 5-6:30pm, there would be 
a discussion  about a farm-to- table dinner on River Street. River Street would be closed down for 
this special event. Over three hundred people have expressed interest in attending and over sixty 
people have offered to volunteer for the event. Callahan stated that they are planning on having 
this dinner on Saturday, August 6 th , which is the last weekend of  National  Farmer’s Market 
Week.  Discussion would be held on the procedure and process on what needs to be done to hold 
such an event.  Callahan  has  spoken to the City Planner and has  a background packet for this 
meeting. 

Callahan stated that Flag Day is tomorrow.

Brown stated that there is a River Corridor discussion tomorrow night at Geneva City Hall at 
6pm. 

14. Adjournment
There being no other business to discuss ,  Chair  Brown   asked for a motion  to adjourn th e meeting 
at 8:44pm; Made by Hohmann; Seconded by O’Brien. Motion carried.

Minutes respectfully submitted by Jennifer Austin-Smith



 CITY OF BATAVIA 

DATE: February 15, 2016 

TO: Committee of the Whole 

FROM: Drew Rackow AICP, Planner 

SUBJECT: Ordinance 16-11: Grant of Approvals for Variances for a Detached Garage 
514 Main Street – Spillane and Sons, Inc., Applicant

Summary: The Zoning Board of Appeals (ZBA) held a Public Hearing on February 3
rd

 to

review variance requests from the Zoning Code for a proposed replacement garage for 514 Main 

Street.  The variance requests would provide relief from Table 2.104 to allow a garage to be 

constructed with a two foot interior side setback rather than the required five feet and a two foot 

rear setback instead of the required five feet. 

The applicant indicated that the variances would provide the most appropriate location for a 

replacement garage, balancing access and navigation concerns with the factors of the existing 

home and driveway.  The Zoning Board noted difficulties in meeting the current setbacks, with 

the location of the screened porch and the driveway.  The consensus of the ZBA was for a 

positive recommendation for the requested setback variances. 

Background:  Please see the January 29
th

 Staff Memo to the ZBA (attached) for a full analysis

of the proposal.  In their review the ZBA discussed the applicant’s requested setback, versus the 

staff recommendation to meet the existing garage setback.  Mr. Spillane noted site geometry 

issues that would remain with an increased rear setback and the proposed garage size.  An 

existing screened porch would also reduce maneuvering space for a garage located further east 

on the property. 

No members of the public addressed the ZBA.  The Zoning Board discussed whether alternative 

placements of the garage, such as rotating the structure to meet the setbacks would be feasible.  

The ZBA concluded that the applicant’s request for a reduced setback would best resolve the 

existing site conditions.  The ZBA found that the Findings of Approval would be met for the 

requested setbacks.  The ZBA included a recommendation that the service door be located on the 

east side of the structure.   

Alternatives: The City Council can approve the Ordinance as presented, add or modify conditions, 

or not approve the Ordinance. 

 Pros: Approval of the Ordinance will allow the applicant to proceed with the proposed

garage in association with other site improvements.

 Cons:  Approval would place improvements closer to the property line than otherwise

allowed by the Zoning Code.

 Budget Impact: None



 Staff Impact: None

Timeline for Actions: COW action on Ordinance 16-11 on February 23
rd

 will allow the

Ordinance to appear on the March 7
th

 City Council agenda for final action.

Recommendations: By a vote of 4-1, the ZBA recommended approval of the requested variance 

for setbacks, with the condition of the service door located to the east elevation, rather than the 

west elevation. 

Staff recommends approval of draft Ordinance 16-11 as presented. 

Attachment: Zoning Board Memo 

Draft Minutes 

Draft Ordinance 16-11 

C: Mike Spillane, Applicant 

Department Heads 

Media 



 

 

 

CITY OF BATAVIA 
 
DATE: January 29, 2016 

TO: Zoning Board of Appeals 

FROM: Drew Rackow, AICP, Planner 

SUBJECT: PUBLIC HEARING: Variances for a Replacement Garage at 514 Main Street 

Spillane and Sons, Mike Spillane, Applicant 

 

Background and Information Provided by the Applicants 

Mike Spillane, who recently acquired the residence at 514 Main Street, has submitted an application for 

variances from the Zoning Code to allow for the replacement of an existing non-conforming detached garage.  

The applicant has requested two variances for rear and interior side setbacks for an accessory structure.  The 

existing 16 foot x 18 foot garage is constructed at 2 feet from the interior side property line and 4.5 feet from the 

rear property line instead of the required 5 foot rear setbacks.  The applicant proposes a 20 feet x 20 feet two car 

garage with a setback of 2 feet for both the interior and rear setback.   The residence was constructed in 1925 

and is zoned R1-H, Single Family Residential – High Density.  Records do not indicate the date of the original 

construction of the garage.  Mr. Spillane proposes the new garage as part of a rehabilitation of the existing 

home.  An 8 foot x 10 foot shed located in the rear yard is not depicted on the provided survey and site plan. 

In his letter to the Zoning Board, Mr. Spillane explains that the close proximity to the existing home would limit 

movements in and out of the garage and has noted that relocating further to the east would diminish the limited 

existing back yard. 

 

Staff Analysis 

In the R1-H District, a detached garage must be setback five feet from the side and rear property line.  As the 

existing garage is non-conforming, it cannot be reconstructed in place without a variance request.  A small lean-

to shed exists along the rear of the existing garage, which pushes the existing garage even closer to the property 

line than the 4.5 feet setback of the main structure.  A screened in porch protrudes from the rear of the main 

house, leaving a separation of approximately 19.5 feet from the existing garage.  The applicant’s proposal would 

provide a separation from the house of approximately 20.3 feet.  The existing home has nonconforming side 

setbacks with the existing driveway location being the only means to provide access for a garage.   

Staff believes that it is reasonable to consider a 2 foot side setback rather than the required 5 feet.  The existing 

garage has existed in this location without reported issues.  Relocation of the garage to a 5 foot setback would 

decrease the amount of yard space, placing the garage closer to the existing shed, and requiring greater turning 

movements to access all portions of the garage.   The proposed garage size, which is minimal for a two car 

garage, placed to comply with setbacks, would occupy half of the width of the rear yard.  A two foot side 

setback would best address existing driveway.  Prior to the adoption of the 2010 Zoning Code, the required 

setback for the garage was 3 feet.   

Staff believes that the requested two foot setback at the rear would introduce conditions that don’t presently 

exist with the rear setback.  While there is an approximately two foot lean-to structure at the rear of the existing 

garage, it spans less than half of the structure.   Given its shorter height and smaller bulk relative to the main 

structure, staff would not support using this as a basis for the rear setback.  Instead, the existing structure itself is 

4.5 feet from the property line according to the provided survey.  Staff feels a more reasonable request would be 

to place the proposed replacement garage at 4.5 feet, reflective of the existing condition on the site. This setback 

would provide approximately 18.5 feet of distance from the house.  This may provide sufficient access for 

vehicles to maneuver into the proposed garage. 

The drawings show the proposed service door on the west side.  This door should be installed on the east side, 

the opposite side of the proposed minimal setback.   



 

2 

 

Review of Findings 

As indicated, staff is supportive of a request to place the garage with an interior setback of 2 feet and a rear 

setback of 4.5 feet.  Staff has drafted Findings, based on this conclusion.  As noted in the Staff Recommendation 

below, staff recommends that the Board evaluate the Findings if an alternate recommendation is made.   

Under our Code and State Statute, the Zoning Board of Appeals (ZBA) is to consider all information submitted 

by the applicants and provided by staff, together with the information given at the public hearing.  The ZBA 

must determine if the required variance Findings for Approval have been met. 

Section 5.503 in Zoning Code Chapter 5.5: Variances establishes Findings the ZBA must reach before voting on 

a recommendation of approval or denial to the City Council’s Committee of the Whole (COW).  Below is each 

of the required findings from Section 5.503 followed by staff analysis.  

Finding A: There are unique circumstances applicable to the property, including its size, shape, topography, 

location or surroundings, where strict application of the Zoning Code would create a hardship or 

other practical difficulty, as distinguished from a mere inconvenience, and deprive the property 

owner of property rights enjoyed by other property owners in the same zoning district. 

The subject parcel conforms to the dimension and size requirements for the R1-H District.  There are non-

conforming side setbacks for the principal structure that limit locations where a driveway to access the garage 

may be located.  Existing improvements to the home limit opportunities to locate a garage further from the 

parcel lines and create a practical difficulty, given existing conditions on the site, to permit a two car garage on 

the site. 

Staff believes that this finding is met.  

 

Finding B: Such unique circumstances were not created by the current or previous owners or  applicant. 

The placement of the existing structure and other improvements is the underlying cause for the variance.  The 

decision to place the house and garage at these locations would have been made at the original time of 

construction, by a previous owner.  The original placement likely conformed to the Zoning Codes at that time; 

however they no longer do so, and thus may have not been created by the previous owners.  While staff did not 

find records confirming the status, it believes it was constructed in conformance with Codes at that time by 

previous owners. Mr. Spillane, as the current owner has not created any of the existing circumstances. 

Staff believes this finding is met.   

 

Finding C: The property cannot yield a reasonable return or be reasonably used for the purpose intended by 

the Zoning Code under the regulations in the district in which it is located. 

The property currently is built with a residence, the highest and best use of the R1-H District. It is served by an 

existing, but deteriorated two car garage.  A new two car garage would enhance the functional and value of the 

property.  Due to the existing site constraints, a garage in a conforming location would reduce available land for 

yard space, or could be sized only for one vehicle. 

Staff believes that this finding is met.   

 

Finding D: The variance does not constitute a grant of special privileges inconsistent with the limitations 

upon other properties in the vicinity and zone in which such property is located. 

Other homes in the area and district do have opportunities to locate two car garages on their properties, and thus 

the request is not inconsistent with the allowances of the Zoning District.  Other parcels seeking to rebuild non-

conforming garages could also seek such a variance. 

 

Staff believes this finding is met. 

 

Finding E:  The variance will not be materially detrimental to persons residing or working in the  

  vicinity, to adjacent property, to the neighborhood, or the public welfare in general. 

 



 

3 

 

The existing garage has not had a negative effect on the surrounding area.   Detached garages at the rear of the 

property are consistently found in this neighborhood.   The proposed setbacks, as conditioned, would provide 

essentially the same setbacks as existing. 

 

Staff believes this finding is met.   

 

Staff believes that all five of the required findings are met. 

 

Staff Recommendation 

Staff recommends the ZBA to open and conduct the public hearing.  If no additional information is required, the 

hearing may be closed after all testimony has been received.  The ZBA should discuss the required findings, and 

should determine if it believes all of the findings may be met with its provided recommendation.   

Staff recommends that the Zoning Board recommend approval of a garage with the existing rear setback of 4.5 

feet and an interior side setback of 2 feet, rather than the requested 2 feet on both setbacks with a condition 

requiring that the service door be located on the east elevation, rather than the west elevation.  

 

Attachment:  Variance application material 

 

c Mayor and City Council 

 Department Heads 

 Mike Spillane, Applicant 

 Media 

















From: William James Griffing   

Date: January 26, 2016 at 9:20:14 PM CST 

To: Mike Spillane 

Subject: 514 Main Street 

Mike, 

 

We appreciate your efforts to communicate with us and others in the neighborhood regarding 

your plans for rehabbing the property next door to us. As you can imagine, we are deeply 

interested in the project as this adjoining property probably affects our property value more than 

any other. We were pleased that you purchased the property and we have confidence that you 

will do a quality job in restoring the home to its former glory. 

 

Regarding your petition for a variance on the setback provisions, we support your petition. 

Please let us know if you think you will have any difficulty getting the city to approve your 

variance. Constructing the new garage on the footprint you propose is the only logical way to 

make use of the site without destroying what is otherwise a relatively small back yard to begin 

with. 

 

Good luck with your project. 

 

Sincerely, — William & Rosemary Griffing, 504 Main Street 

  



From: Barbara Moore  

Date: January 22, 2016 at 1:55:17 PM CST 

To:  Mike Spillane 

Subject: Changes to the property on Main Street 

 

Hi Mike, 

 

My name is Barbara Moore and my husband's name is Gregory Moore.  We live at 222 South 

Jefferson St and received your letter outlining your proposed changes to the house and garage.  

We have always admired all of your home renovations and have absolutely no issue with any 

changes/updates you are going to make to the home on Main Street. 

 

The house was really starting to look run down and we were concerned about its future.  But 

when we saw your business sign in the front yard we knew it would receive a beautiful and much 

needed renovation. 

 

Please feel free to use this letter as a show of support when you present your case before the 

Zoning Board. 

 

Sincerely. 

 

Barbara & Gregory Moore 

 







DRAFT 

DRAFT 

MINUTES 

February 3, 2016 

ZONING BOARD OF APPEALS   

City of Batavia 

 

PLEASE NOTE: These minutes are not a word-for-word transcription of the statements made at 

the meeting, nor intended to be a comprehensive review of all discussions. They are intended to 

make an official record of the actions taken by the Committee/City Council, and to include some 

description of discussion points as understood by the minute-taker. They may not reference some 

of the individual attendee’s comments, nor the complete comments if referenced. 

 

1. Meeting Called to Order of the Zoning Board of Appeals 

Chair LaLonde called the meeting to order at 7:00pm.  

 

2. Roll Call: 

 

Members Present:  Chair LaLonde; Vice-Chair Schneider; Commissioners Harms, 

Joseph, Peterson and Gosselin 

 

Members Absent:  

 

Also Present:  Drew Rackow, Planner; Joel Strassman, Planning and Zoning 

Officer; and Jennifer Austin-Smith, Recording Secretary  

 

3. Items to be Removed, Added or Changed 

There were no items to be removed, added or changed. 

 

4. Public Hearing: Variances for a Replacement Garage at 514 Main Street; Spillane and 

Sons, Mike Spillane, Applicant 

514 Main Street 

 

Motion: To open the Public Hearing 

Maker: Gosselin 

Second: Joseph 

Voice Vote: 6 Ayes, 0 Nays, 0 Absent 

   All in favor. Motion carried 

 

Tom Gosselin recused himself from this Public Hearing due to being the applicant’s attorney. 

 

Rackow reported that tonight’s hearing is for a replacement garage at 514 Main Street. Mike 

Spillane, applicant, would like a variance for a 2 ft rear variance and a 2 ft setback to the interior 

side property line versus the required 5 ft for both. The existing 16 x 18 garage is proposed to be 

replaced with a 20 x 20 garage. The shed on the property would remain at the current location. 

The close proximity to the existing home would limit the movements out of the proposed garage 

and moving the garage further to the east would diminish the amount of backyard on the 

property. The property was built in 1925 and is zoned R1H. Staff concurs with the request for a 2 

ft side setback but recommends a 4.5 ft setback for the rear, reflective of the existing condition 

on the site.  



Zoning Board of Appeals DRAFT 

February 3, 2016 

Page 2 

DRAFT 

Joseph asked if they are required to have a utility easement. Rackow stated that there is no 

easement on the plat of survey and there are not easements on either side. LaLonde asked if the 

applicant replaced the garage in the exact footprint would they still need a variance. Rackow 

answered they would still need a variance due to the nonconforming status of the structure.  

Chair LaLonde swore in the applicant.  Mike Spillane, Spillane and Sons, shared that he lives 

around the corner and owns this building in question. He pointed out that the letters of support 

from the neighborhood were unsolicited and he does not know the people who wrote them. The 

suggested 4.5 ft would make it difficult to get in and out of the garage because of the existing 

screened porch. There is no problem with the proposed condition for the service door location. 

To make it easier for the cars to exit and enter the garage they plan on removing the existing 

fence. The whole home will be rehabbed and brought down to the studs. There will be a whole 

new home inside the building. The driveway is in relatively good shape and they would like to 

leave as much as they can. He shared that no one has lived in that home for nine years. The 

driveway is shared with the neighbors and that is another reason for the variance request, to 

increase the safety and maneuverability of the vehicles.  

LaLonde stated that he appreciates what Spillane’s company has done in town with the older 

homes. LaLonde asked if the applicant considered turning the garage slightly. Spillane answered 

that it would create space in the backyard that would be unusable. There would be a pie shape in 

one corner of the lot and another pie in the back. Joseph stated that the garage would be 2.5 ft 

closer to the house and asked if it would be a small garage. Spillane stated that there is a not a lot 

of room in that location to work with and it is a small two car garage.  

Motion: To close the Public Hearing 

Maker: Peterson 

Second: Harms 

Voice Vote: 6 Ayes, 0 Nays, 0 Absent 

All in favor. Motion carried. 

LaLonde stated that, due to maneuverability, he could see the validity of having a variance of 2 ft 

for both property lines. Rackow stated that the Commission could consider if the 2 ft setback is 

enough and could recommend approval of the variances. LaLonde stated that he is in support of 

the applicant’s request. Strassman noted that the Findings of Fact were written with the four-foot 

setback and the approval of the Findings of Fact would have to be adjusted to the applicant’s 

requested two-foot setback.  

Motion: To approve the Findings of Fact in the affirmative, with the setbacks requested by 

the applicant 

Maker: Peterson 

Second: Harms 

Discussion was held on the motion. Joseph commented that she is not comfortable approving the 

adjusted Findings of Fact at this time. She explained that she does not have enough time to 

review each finding in regards to the two-foot setback.  



Zoning Board of Appeals DRAFT 

February 3, 2016 

Page 3 

DRAFT 

Roll Call Vote: Aye:  Harms, LaLonde, Peterson, Schneider  

Nay:  Joseph 

4-1 Vote, 0 Absent, 1 Recusal, Motion carried. 

Motion: To approve the variances for the garage with a two-foot setback and a two-foot 

side-yard setback with the condition that the service door be located on the east 

elevation 

Maker: Peterson 

Second: Schneider 

Roll Call Vote: Aye:  Harms, LaLonde, Peterson, Schneider 

Nay:  Joseph 

4-1 Vote, 0 Absent, 1 Recusal, Motion carried. 

Tom Gosselin returned to the meeting 7:25 pm. 

5. Other Business

Strassman reported that the Dunkin Donuts discussion would be at the Historic Preservation 

Commission (HPC) meeting on Monday, February 8, 2016. The HPC would be reviewing the 

proposed signs and changes to the building. The Committee of the Whole (COW) should discuss 

the zoning issues at the first COW meeting in March.  

6. Adjournment

There being no other business to discuss, Chair LaLonde asked for a motion to adjourn the 

Zoning Board of Appeals meeting. Harms moved to adjourn the meeting, Gosselin seconded. All 

were in favor. The motion carried. The meeting was adjourned at 7:26 pm. 

Minutes respectfully submitted by Jennifer Austin-Smith 



1 of 4 pages, excluding Exhibits A and B 

CITY OF BATAVIA, ILLINOIS 

ORDINANCE 16-11 

 

GRANT OF VARIANCE FOR A DETACHED GARAGE 

Spillane and Sons Inc., Applicant  

(514 Main Street) 

 

ADOPTED BY THE 

MAYOR AND CITY COUNCIL 

THIS 7
th 

 DAY OF MARCH, 2016 

 

 

Published in pamphlet form Prepared by: 

by authority of the Mayor  

and City Council of the City of Batavia, City of Batavia 

Kane & DuPage Counties, Illinois, 100 N. Island Ave. 

This 8
th

 day of March, 2016 Batavia, IL 60510 

 



 

2 of 4 pages, excluding Exhibits A and B 

CITY OF BATAVIA, ILLINOIS 

ORDINANCE 16-11 

GRANT OF VARIANCE FOR A DETACHED GARAGE 

Spillane and Sons Inc., Applicant 

(514 Main Street) 

WHEREAS, Spillane and Sons Inc., owner of 514 Main Street and legally described as: 

LOT 1 (EXCEPT THE EAST 105 FEET) IN BLOCK 2 OF INSTITUTE ADDITION 
TO BATAVIA, IN CITY OF BATAVIA, KANE COUNTY, ILLINOIS (PIN 12-22-
304-004)  

have filed an application for a Zoning Variance from Table 2.104 in the Batavia Zoning Code (City 
Code Title 10), to allow construction of a replacement detached garage for a single family residence in 
the R1-H Zoning District to have an interior side setback of 2 feet instead of the required 5 feet and a 
rear setback of 2 feet rather than the required 5 feet; and 

WHEREAS, notice was duly executed and a public hearing held by the Zoning Board of Appeals on 
February 3, 2016; and 

WHEREAS, following said hearing, the Zoning Board of Appeals made the following findings: 

1. There are unique circumstances applicable to the property, including its size, shape, 
topography, location or surroundings, strict application of the Zoning Code would create a 
hardship or other practical difficulty, as distinguished from a mere inconvenience, and deprive 
the property owner of property rights enjoyed by other property owners in the same zoning 
district; 
 

2. Such unique circumstances were not created by the current or previous owners or applicant; 
 
3. The property cannot yield a reasonable return or be reasonably used for the purpose intended 

by the Zoning Code under the regulations in the district in which it is located; 
 

4. The variance does not constitute a grant of special privileges inconsistent with the limitations 
upon other properties in the vicinity and zone in which such property is located; 
 

5. The variance will not be materially detrimental to persons residing or working in the vicinity, to 
adjacent property, to the neighborhood, or the public welfare in general; and 

 
WHEREAS, following said hearing, the Zoning Board of Appeals recommended approval of the 
requested variances from the City of Batavia Zoning Code, subject to the condition of the garage 
service door being located on the  east side, facing the interior of the lot; and 

WHEREAS, the Batavia City Council’s Committee of the Whole has reviewed the application, the 
record of the public hearing, and the actions and findings of the Zoning Board of Appeals; and 



CITY OF BATAVIA, ILLINOIS ORDINANCE 16-11 

3 of 4 pages, excluding Exhibits A and B 

 

WHEREAS, the Committee of the Whole has recommended approval of the requested variances in 
accordance with the recommendations of the Zoning Board of Appeals. 

 
NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT HEREBY ORDAINED by the City Council of the City of Batavia, 
Kane and DuPage Counties, Illinois as follows: 

SECTION 1: That the application by Mike Spillane on behalf of Spillane and Sons Inc., owner of 514 
Main Street for a Zoning Variance from Table 2.104 in the Batavia Zoning Code (City Code Title 10), 
to allow construction of a replacement detached garage for a single family residence in the R1-H 
Zoning District to have an interior side setback of 2 feet instead of the required 5 feet and a rear 
setback of 2 feet rather than the required 5 feet, in accordance with the Exhibits attached hereto, is 
approved, subject to the condition of the garage service door being located on the east side, facing the 
interior of the lot. 

Exhibit Plan Dated Prepared by 

A Plat of Survey  August 22, 1989 
Schlaf – Seding & 

Associates 

B Garage Building Plans Undated Mike Spillane 

 
SECTION 2: That this Ordinance 16-11 shall be in full force and effect upon its presentation, passage 
and publication according to law.  

PRESENTED to and PASSED by the City Council of the City of Batavia, Illinois, this 7
th

 day of 

March, 2016. 

 

APPROVED by me as Mayor of said City of Batavia, Illinois, this 7
th

 day of March, 2016. 

  ______________________________  

 Jeffery D. Schielke, Mayor 

Ward Aldermen Ayes Nays Absent Abstain Aldermen Ayes Nays Absent Abstain 

1 O’Brien     Fischer     

2 Callahan     Wolff     

3 Hohmann     Chanzit     

4 Mueller     Stark     

5 Botterman     Atac     

6 Cerone     Clark     

7 McFadden     Brown     

Mayor Schielke     

VOTE: Ayes Nays Absent Abstention(s)  

Total holding office: Mayor and 14 aldermen 

 



CITY OF BATAVIA, ILLINOIS ORDINANCE 16-11 

4 of 4 pages, excluding Exhibits A and B 

 

ATTEST: 

 _____________________________  

 Heidi Wetzel, City Clerk 
 



Exhibit "A" of Ordinance 16-11



Exhibit "B" of Ordinance 16-11 
Page 1 of 4



Exhibit "B" of Ordinance 16-11 
Page 2 of 4



Exhibit "B" of Ordinance 16-11 Page 3 of 4



Exhibit "B" of Ordinance 16-11 Page 4 of 4



 CITY OF BATAVIA 
 
 
DATE:  February 15, 2016 
TO:  Committee of the Whole-CS 
FROM: Jeff Albertson, Building Commissioner 
SUBJECT: Ordinance 16-13: Adoption of 2015 International Property Maintenance Code  
 
Summary:  Staff is proposing to update the2006 edition of the International Property Maintenance 
Code (IPMC) to the 2015 edition. 
  
 
Background:   Staff has been working on updates to our adopted code series, the International 
Codes. These include the codes that regulate all aspects of construction and systems. The last time 
these codes were updated was 2007, so we are overdue for an update. The first code we have ready to 
bring forward is the 2015 International Property Maintenance Code. 
 
The IPMC would regulate the maintenance and repair of all properties within the city. This 
includes painting, building deterioration, paving, weeds, junk storage and similar items. Our 
existing adopted code is the 2006 edition of the IPMC. The format and requirements of the 2015 
IPMC are similar to previous editions. Following are the significant changes in this edition of the 
code. 
 

1. Dangerous structures or premises- This is a new section to the code that establishes a 
baseline of conditions to determine if its present condition is dangerous. It allows the 
code official to cite specific conditions under which he or she finds a structure to be 
dangerous. It focuses on the adequacy of the means of egress, structural, fire protection, 
plumbing and ventilation systems. 

2. Unsafe conditions for exterior of structure- This is a new section that establishes specific 
exterior conditions of an unsafe structure. This will allow the code official to cite these 
conditions to declare the exterior portion of the structure unsafe and require repair or 
replacement. 

3. Unsafe conditions for interior of structure- This is a new section that establishes specific 
interior conditions of an unsafe structure. This will allow the code official to cite these 
conditions to declare the interior portion of the structure unsafe and require repair or 
replacement. 

4. Overcrowding- This section has been revised to apply square footage requirements to be 
able to determine an overcrowding situation. Previous editions of the code had a 
somewhat arbitrary statement about leaving it up to the opinion of the code official. This 
language was subjective and difficult if not impossible to enforce.  

 
 
Alternatives:  
 
-  Adopt the 2015 International Property Maintenance Code as proposed in Ordinance 16-13       
above 
-  Keep the current 2006 Property Maintenance Code in place. 
 



a. Pros- The adoption and enforcement of the property maintenance code helps to improve 
property values, the health and safety of the community. Updates the requirements to 
keep the City with the most current requirements.   
  

b. Cons-  No enforcement causes blight, lower property values, safety concerns and makes 
Batavia less desirable to residents and businesses. Without fairly regular updates the 
standards become outdated and are less likely to hold up to any required legal 
enforcement action.  
 

c. Budget Impact- Should have little impact on the budget. We have to purchase a couple 
of additional copies of code books. Those books have been included in the 2016 Budget.  
 

d. Staffing Impact- No staffing impact at this time.     
 
Timeline for actions: There is no specific timeline for action.  
 
Staff recommendation: Staff recommends adoption of Ordinance 16-13: Adoption of the 2015 
edition of the International Property Maintenance Code. 
 
Attachments: 
 

1. Draft Ordinance 16-13 
 
Cc: Mayor & City Council 
 File 



 

1 of 3 pages  

CITY OF BATAVIA, ILLINOIS 
ORDINANCE 16-13 

AN ORDINANCE AMENDING TITLE 9 OF  
THE MUNICIPAL CODE OF THE CITY OF BATAVIA FOR PROPERTY 

MAINTENANCE REGULATIONS FOR EXISTING STRUCTURES 

ADOPTED BY THE 
MAYOR AND CITY COUNCIL 

THIS _______DAY OF________, 2016 

 

 
Published in pamphlet form Prepared by: 
by authority of the Mayor  
and City Council of the City of Batavia, City of Batavia 
Kane & DuPage Counties, Illinois, 100 N. Island Ave. 
This _____day of ________, 2016 Batavia, IL 60510 
 



 

2 of 3 pages  

CITY OF BATAVIA, ILLINOIS 
ORDINANCE 16-13 

AN ORDINANCE AMENDING TITLE 9 OF  
THE MUNICIPAL CODE OF THE CITY OF BATAVIA FOR PROPERTY 

MAINTENANCE REGULATIONS FOR EXISTING STRUCTURES 

WHEREAS, The International Property Maintenance Code, 2015 Edition establishes minimum 
standards governing all matters concerning the maintenance, and control of all existing property, 
buildings and structures; and 

WHEREAS, adoption of the International Property Maintenance Code would be in the best 
interest of the City of Batavia as well as the health and safety of its citizens; 

NOW THEREFORE, BE IT ORDAINED by the Mayor and City Council of the City of 
Batavia, Kane and DuPage Counties, Illinois, as follows: 

SECTION 1: That Title 9, Chapter 12 of the Batavia Municipal Code shall be deleted in its 
entirety, and replace with the text  as attached in Exhibit A: 



CITY OF BATAVIA, ILLINOIS ORDINANCE 16-13 

3 of 3 pages  

SECTION 2: This Ordinance 16-13 shall be in full force and effect upon its presentation, p-
assage and publication according to law.  

PRESENTED to and PASSED by the City Council of the City of Batavia, Illinois, this  
______day of _______, 2016 APPROVED by me as Mayor of said City of Batavia, Illinois, this 
_____ day of ________, 2016. 

 ______________________________ 

 Jeffery D. Schielke, Mayor 
 

 

Ward Aldermen Ayes Nays Absent Abstain Aldermen Ayes Nays Absent Abstain 
1 O’Brien     Fischer     
2 Callahan     Wolff     
3 Hohmann     Chanzit     
4 Mueller     Stark     
5 Botterman     Atac     
6 Cerone     Russotto     
7 McFadden     Brown     
Mayor Schielke     
VOTE: Ayes Nays Absent Abstention(s) counted as ________ 
Total holding office: Mayor and 14 aldermen 
 

 

ATTEST: 

______________________________ 

 Heidi Wetzel, City Clerk 



Exhibit A to Ordinance 16-13 

Chapter 12 
PROPERTY MAINTENANCE 

9-12-1: SCOPE OF REGULATIONS: 
9-12-2: PERMITS AND GENERAL REQUIREMENTS: 
9-12-3: PROPERTY MAINTENANCE CODE ADOPTION: 
9-12-4: SPECIFIC AMENDMENTS TO THE CODE: 
 
9-12-1: SCOPE OF REGULATIONS: 
 
The provisions of this chapter shall be applicable to all property, buildings, and structures within the city 
of Batavia.  
 
9-12-2: PERMITS AND GENERAL REQUIREMENTS: 
 
See Chapter 1 of this title.  
 
9-12-3: PROPERTY MAINTENANCE CODE ADOPTION: 
 
The provisions of the 2015 edition of the International Property Maintenance code published by the 
International Code Council, 4051 Flossmoor Road, Country Club Hills, IL 60478, not less than three (3) 
copies of which have been and now are on file in the office of the city clerk of the city of Batavia, Illinois, 
are hereby adopted together with the special regulations listed herein modifying said International 
Property Maintenance code as the regulations governing maintenance and control of all property, 
buildings, and structures in the City of Batavia, Kane County, Illinois.  
 
9-12-4: SPECIFIC AMENDMENTS TO THE CODE: 
 
The International Property Maintenance code, as herein above adopted by reference, is specifically 
amended as follows: 
 
CHAPTER 1  
ADMINISTRATION CITY OF BATAVIA  
 
Section 101.1 Title: Revise to read as follows: 
 
101.1 Title. These regulations shall be known as the Property Maintenance Code of the City of Batavia, 
hereinafter referred to as "this code." 
 
Section 102.3 Application of Other Codes: Revise to read as follows:  
 
102.3 Application of Other Codes. Repairs, additions, or alterations to a structure, or changes of 
occupancy shall be done in accordance with title 9 of the Batavia Municipal Code. 
 
Section 102.3.1 Plumbing Code: Add a new section to read as follows:  
 
102.3.1 Plumbing Code. All references to the International Plumbing Code shall be deemed to mean the 
Illinois Plumbing Code as adopted in section 9-6-3 of the Batavia Municipal Code. 
 
Section 102.3.2 Electrical Code: Add a new section to read as follows:  
 
102.3.2 Electric Code. All references to the ICC Electrical Code shall be deemed to mean the National 

http://www.sterlingcodifiers.com/codebook/getBookData.php?chapter_id=38976#s351144
http://www.sterlingcodifiers.com/codebook/getBookData.php?chapter_id=38976#s351145
http://www.sterlingcodifiers.com/codebook/getBookData.php?chapter_id=38976#s351146
http://www.sterlingcodifiers.com/codebook/getBookData.php?chapter_id=38976#s351147
http://www.sterlingcodifiers.com/codebook/?ft=2&find=1
http://www.sterlingcodifiers.com/codebook/?ft=1&find=9
http://www.sterlingcodifiers.com/codebook/?ft=3&find=9-6-3


Exhibit A to Ordinance 16-13 
Electric Code as adopted in section 9-5-3 of the Batavia Municipal Code. 
 
Section 102.3.3 Mechanical Code: Add a new section to read as follows:  
 
102.3.3 Mechanical Code. All references to the ICC Mechanical Code shall be deemed to mean the 
Mechanical Code of the City of Batavia as adopted in section 9-14-3 of the Batavia Municipal Code. 
 
Section 102.3.4 Fire Code: Add a new section to read as follows:  
 
102.3.4 Fire Code. All references to the ICC Fire Code shall be deemed to mean the International Fire 
Code as adopted in section 9-11-1 of the Batavia Municipal Code. 
 
Section 102.3.5 Fuel Gas Code: Add a new section to read as follows: 
 
102.3.5 Fuel Gas Code. All references to the ICC Fuel Gas code shall be deemed to mean the 
International Fuel Gas Code as adopted in section 9-15-3 of the Batavia Municipal Code. 
 
Section 102.3.6 Energy Code: Add a new section to read as follows: 
 
102.3.6 Energy Code. All references to the ICC Energy Code shall be deemed to mean the Energy 
Conservation Code as adopted in section 9-16-4 of the Batavia Municipal Code. 
 
Section 102.6 Historic Buildings. Delete in its entirety 
 
Section 102.7 Exception: Revise to read as follows:  
 
Section 102.7 Exception. Where enforcement of the code provision would violate the conditions of the 
listing of the equipment or appliance, the conditions of the listing and manufacturer's instructions shall 
apply. 
 
Section 103.1 General: Revise to read as follows:  
 
103.1 General. There is a Building and Inspection Department for the city, created under section 1-8C of 
the Batavia Municipal Code. The Community Development Director, Building and Inspection  
Commissioner, Building Inspector, and the Planning and Zoning Officer and Code Compliance Officer 
designated under title 10 of the Batavia Municipal Code shall collectively be known as the "Code 
Official" as herein used. 
 
103.5 Fees: Delete in its entirety 
 
Section 106.4 Violation Penalties: Revise to read as follows:  
 
106.4 Violation Penalties. Any person who shall violate a provision of this code, or fail to comply 
therewith, or with any of the requirements thereof, shall be guilty of an offense punishable as follows: 
 
(1)The fine for the first violation shall be one hundred (100) dollars. 
 
(2)The fine for the second violation shall be two hundred and fifty (250) dollars. 
 
(3)The fine for the third violation shall be five hundred (500) dollars. 
 
(4)The fine for the fourth and all subsequent violations shall be seven hundred and fifty (750) dollars. 
 
 
 

http://www.sterlingcodifiers.com/codebook/?ft=3&find=9-5-3
http://www.sterlingcodifiers.com/codebook/?ft=3&find=9-5-3
http://www.sterlingcodifiers.com/codebook/?ft=1&find=10


Exhibit A to Ordinance 16-13 
 
Unless the fine for violation is listed in the Batavia Municipal Code, the above fine structure shall be 
used. Should the provisions of any referenced material be in conflict with the referenced material of any 
other, the more stringent requirements shall be applicable. Each day that a violation continues after due 
notice has been served shall be deemed a separate and distinct offense. 
 
Section 107.2 Form: Delete item number 6. 
 
Section 108.2.1.1 Boarding Standard: Add a new section to read as follows:  
 
108.2.1.1 Boarding Standard. When the Building Official causes a premises to be closed or secured, it is 
intended to be a temporary safeguard preventing access to the premises or structure of from being a 
nuisance. All doors, windows, or openings shall be covered with solid materials that are fastened or 
connected to prevent free access to the structure by persons and shall be painted to correspond to the color 
of the existing structure. To consider the structure or premises closed, secure, and not readily accessible, 
all openings shall be boarded or secured in an approved manner. 
 
Section 110.1 General: Revise to read as follows:  
 
110.1 General. The City may demolish, repair, or enclose, or cause the demolition, repair, or enclosure of 
dangerous and unsafe buildings or uncompleted and abandoned buildings within the territory of the city 
and further recover its costs in connection therewith pursuant to the provisions of applicable Illinois State 
Statute. (65 ILCS 5/11-31-1, et. seq.) 
 
Sections 110.2, 110.3, 110.4 Demolition: Delete these sections. 
 
Section 111 Means of Appeals: Revise to read as follows: 
 
Section 111 Means Of Appeal. 
 
1. Any person aggrieved by a decision of the Code Official may appeal said decision. Application for 
appeal may be made when the party asserts that the intent of the code has been met by the party's 
submitted plans or construction or that the code has been incorrectly interpreted or that substitute 
construction and protective assemblies and systems will provide as good as or better structure or building 
when completed. Any appeal shall be in writing as set forth below. 
 
2. The Committee of the City Council as designated by the City Administrator from time to time shall 
receive and review any written application for appeal of any such decision of the Code Official. Such 
appeal must be filed with the Code Official within ten (10) days of the Code Official's written decision. 
 
3. Within forty-five (45) days of the date of filing the written appeal, the designated Committee shall meet 
in public session and take evidence from the party filing the appeal and the Code Official with respect to 
the subject of the appeal. 
 
4. At the conclusion of the taking of the evidence, the Committee shall make written findings of fact 
together with its recommendation and forward same to the full Batavia City Council. 
 
5. The final decision as to whether the appeal shall be granted shall be made by the City Council. In 
making this decision, the City Council shall review only the record of the evidence taken by the 
designated Committee, which shall include the Committee's findings of fact and recommendation. No 
further evidence may be presented to the City Council. The granting of an appeal not constituting a 
variation to the Batavia Municipal Code shall be accomplished by a majority vote upon an appropriate 
motion. Any variation to the Batavia Municipal Code shall be by duly adopted ordinance. 
 
 



Exhibit A to Ordinance 16-13 
 
 
Section 112.4 Failure to Comply:  Revised to read as follows 
 
112.4 Failure to comply. Any person who shall continue any work after having been served with a stop 
work order, except such work as that person is directed to perform to remove a violation or unsafe 
condition, shall be liable to a fine of not less than fifty dollars or more than seven hundred and fifty 
dollars. 
 
Chapter 2  
General Definitions: Revised to read as follows: 
 
Section 202 General Definitions: 
 
INFESTATION. The presence, within or contiguous to a structure or premises, of insects, 
including cockroaches, bedbugs and termites; pest rodents including rats and mice; 
vermin; or other pests. Visible pest residue or debris constitutes an infestation unless 
there is clear evidence that the pest is no longer present. 
 
CHAPTER 3  
Section 302.1 Sanitation: Revised to read as follows 
 
302.1 Sanitation. All exterior property and premises shall be maintained clean, safe, sanitary and free 
from any accumulation of rubbish or garbage. Rubbish and /or garbage shall not be allowed to accumulate 
on the property and, unless it can be properly disposed of, all rubbish/garbage must be contained so as not 
to be scattered by winds or marauding animals. 
 
Section 302.4 Weeds: Revise to read as follows:  
 
302.4 Weeds. The control of weeds shall be regulated by section 4-4-2 of the Batavia Municipal Code. 
 
Section 302.8 Motor Vehicles: Revise to read as follows:  
 
302.8 Motor Vehicles. The control of motor vehicles shall be regulated by section 4-4-1 of the Batavia 
Municipal Code. 
 
Section 302.9 Defacement of Property: Revise to read as follows:  
 
302.9 Defacement of Property. No person shall willfully or wantonly damage, mutilate, or deface any 
exterior surface of any structure or building on any private or public property by placing thereon any 
marking, carving, or graffiti. It shall be the responsibility of the owner to restore said surface to an 
approved state of maintenance and repair immediately upon defacement. 
 
Section 303.2 Enclosures: Revise to read as follows:  
 
303.2 Enclosures. Private swimming pools, hot tubs, and spas containing water more than 24 inches (610 
mm) in depth shall be completely surrounded by a fence or barrier at least 48 inches (1219 mm) in height 
above the finished ground level measured on the side of the barrier away from the pool. Gates and doors 
in such barriers shall be self-closing and self-latching and open outward away from the pool. The gate and 
barrier shall have no opening greater than 1/2 inch within eighteen (18) inches of the release mechanism.  
Openings in the fence or barrier shall not allow a passage of a four (4) inch sphere at any location, or a 
two (2) inch sphere at the bottom. Where the self-latching device is less than 54 inches (1372 mm) above 
the bottom of the gate, the release mechanism shall be located on the pool side of the gate at least three 
(3) inches below the top of the gate. 
  

http://www.sterlingcodifiers.com/codebook/?ft=3&find=4-4-2
http://www.sterlingcodifiers.com/codebook/?ft=3&find=4-4-1


Exhibit A to Ordinance 16-13 
Self closing and self-latching gates shall be maintained such that the gate will positively close and latch 
when released from an open position of 6 inches (152 mm) from the gatepost. No existing pool enclosure 
shall be removed, replaced, or changed in a manner that reduces its effectiveness as a safety barrier. 
 
Section 304.6 Exterior Walls: Revise to add the following: 
 
304.6 Exterior Walls. Exterior walls shall be free from holes, breaks, loose or rotting materials, broken or 
missing mortar and bricks, and shall be maintained by brick replacement, masonry repair, pointing, 
repointing, and tuck pointing to maintain surface integrity and weatherproofing.  
 
Section 304.7 Roofs and drainage: Revise to read as follows; 
 
304.7 Roofs and drainage. The roof and flashing shall be sound, tight and not have defects that admit 
rain. Roof drainage shall be adequate to prevent dampness or deterioration in the walls or interior portion 
of the structure. Roof drains, gutters and downspouts shall be maintained in good 
repair and free from obstructions, including, but not limited to, leaves and vegetative 
growth. Roof water shall not be discharged in a manner that creates a public nuisance. 
 
Section 304.14 Insect Screens: Revise to read as follows:  
 
304.14 Insect Screens. Every door, window and other outside opening required for ventilation of 
habitable rooms, food preparation areas, food service areas or any areas where products to be 
included or utilized in food for human consumption are processed, manufactured, 
packaged or stored shall be supplied with approved tightly fitting screens of minimum 16 
mesh per inch (16 mesh per 25 mm), and every screen door used for insect control shall 
have a self-closing device in good working condition. 
 
Section 304.14 Insect Screens: Delete the exception. 
 
Section 305.3 Interior Surfaces: Revise to read as follows: 
 
Section 305.3 Interior surfaces, including windows and doors, shall be maintained in good, clean and 
sanitary condition. Peeling, chipping, flaking or abraded paint shall be repaired, 
removed or covered. Cracked or loose plaster, decayed wood and other defective surface 
conditions shall be corrected. Surfaces shall have not signs of chronic or persistent 
excessive moisture. Materials discolored or deteriorated by water damage shall be 
cleaned, dried or otherwise repaired and the underlying cause shall be corrected. 
 
Section 307.1 General: Revise to read as follows:  
 
307.1 General. Every exterior and interior flight of stairs having more than three risers shall have a 
handrail on one side of the stair, continuous the full length of the stairs. Ends shall return, or terminate in 
a newel post or safety terminals. Every open portion of a stair, landing, balcony, porch, deck, ramp, or 
other walking surface, which is more than 30 inches (762 mm) above the floor or grade below, shall have 
guards. Handrails shall not be less than 34 inches high or more than 38 inches high measured vertically 
above the nosing of the tread or above the finished floor of the landing or walking surfaces. Guards shall 
not be less than 36 inches high above the floor of the landing, balcony, porch, deck, ramp, or other 
walking surface. 
 
Section 308.2 Disposal of rubbish. Revise to read as follows: 
 
308.2 Disposal of rubbish and garbage. Every occupant of a structure shall dispose of all 
rubbish and garbage in a clean and sanitary manner by placing such rubbish and garbage 
in approved containers. The owner/occupant of the premises shall be responsible for the removal of the 
rubbish and garbage.  



Exhibit A to Ordinance 16-13 
 
Section 308.2 .1 Rubbish storage facilities. Revise to read as follows:  
 
Section 308.2.1 Rubbish and storage facilities. The owner/operator of every 
occupied premises shall supply, and at all times cause to be utilized, approved 
leak proof containers provided with close-fitting covers for the storage of such 
materials until removed from the premises for disposal and shall be responsible for the removal of the 
rubbish and garbage. 
 
Section 309.1 Infestation: Revise to read as follows: 
 
309.1 Infestation. All premises and structures shall be kept free from insect and rodent infestation and 
harborages. All premises and structures in which insects or rodents are found shall be promptly 
exterminated by approved processes that will not be injurious to human health. After extermination, 
proper precautions shall be taken to prevent reinfestation. It shall be the owner's responsibility to abate all 
infestations or harborages by extermination. 
 
Section 309.4 Multiple Occupancy: Revise to read as follows: 
 
Section 309.4 Multifamily Occupancy. The owner of a structure containing two or more dwelling units, 
a multiple occupancy, a rooming house or a nonresidential structure shall be responsible for pest 
elimination. If infestation is caused by failure of an occupant to prevent such infestation in the area 
occupied, the occupant and owner shall be responsible for pest elimination. 
 
CHAPTER 6  
MECHANICAL AND ELECTRICAL REQUIREMENTS  
 
Section 602.2 Residential Occupancies: Revise to read as follows: 
 
602.2 Residential Occupancies. Dwellings shall be provided with heating facilities capable of 
maintaining a minimum room temperature of 68 degrees Fahrenheit in all habitable rooms, bathrooms, 
and toilet rooms based on the winter design temperature indicated in table 301.2(1) of the International 
Residential Code. Cooking appliances shall not be used to provide space heating to meet the requirements 
of this section. 
 
Section 602.3 Heat Supply: Revise to read as follows: 
 
602.3 Heat Supply. Every owner and operator of any building who rents, leases, or lets one or more 
dwelling unit, rooming unit, dormitory, or guestroom on terms, either expressed or implied, to furnish 
heat to the occupants thereof shall supply heat during the period from October 15 to May 15 to maintain a 
temperature of not less than 68 degrees Fahrenheit in all habitable rooms, bathrooms, and toilet rooms. 
 
Section 602.3 Exception 1: Revise to read as follows: 
 
1.When the outdoor temperature is below the winter outdoor design temperature for the locality, 
maintenance of the minimum room temperature shall not be required provided that the heating system is 
operating at its full design capacity. The winter outdoor design temperature for the locality shall be as 
indicated in table 301.2 (1) of the International Residential Code. 
 
Section 602.4 Occupiable Workspaces: Revise to read as follows:  
 
602.4 Occupiable Workspaces. Indoor occupiable workspaces shall be supplied with heat during the 
period from October 15 to May 15 to maintain a temperature of not less than 65 degrees Fahrenheit 
during the period the spaces are occupied. 
 



Exhibit A to Ordinance 16-13 
 
 
Section 602.6 When Failure To Furnish Heat Is Not An Offense: Add a new section to read as 
follows: 
 
602.6 When Failure To Furnish Heat Is Not An Offense. Failure to furnish the heat required by this 
section shall not constitute an offense where it is due to a breakdown of the heating plant, if diligence is 
used to have such plant repaired, or where it is due to a strike, to a general shortage of fuel, to any act of 
the tenant who makes the complaint, or to any cause beyond the owner's control; or unless notice of such 
failure to furnish the heat required shall first have been given to the owner or agent of the building. 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

































































































































 CITY OF BATAVIA 
 
DATE:            February 15, 2016 
TO:                 Mayor & City Council 
FROM: Bill McGrath, City Administrator 
SUBJECT: Community Boundary Signage  
 
Per your approval we sent invitations to 10 locale designers, architects, advertising firms and 
sign companies.  4 responded and there is a staff submittal.  They are attached on the enclosed 
PowerPoint .They all seem to be within the same realm of cost except that the decision to make 
of metal or foam can make a big difference.  The submittal with large limestone pieces would 
also be more costly, but I haven’t done any investigation.  This exercise was about the concept 
not constructability.  You were going to review the concepts and, depending upon which you 
liked, would see if we could work out a reasonable agreement for final decision.  I would 
propose to separate the design from the building to see if we can get some competition in the 
building.  
 
Some of the responders submitted a narrative to assist.  Here they are, referred to in PowerPoint 
order. 
 
Submittal 1:  
 
   We propose a single-sided Peachtree Foamcraft monument sign.  This is a synthetic EPS foam 
sign.  It is virtually indestructible and requires zero to little maintenance.  These are some 
examples we have produced.  
 
Submittals 2 and 3: 
    No separate comments 
 
Submittal 4: 
 

OVERVIEW 

Batavia’s history is rich.  We are a city of churches, of industry, science and distinctive 
homes.  We are a river city.  We are sociable and artistic.  Our community spirit is 
expressed in our volunteerism.  We are the city of energy.  We have both a past and a 
future.  All of these descriptors tell a powerful story.  So does this sign. 

 THE SIGN 

We are a community that embraces the arts.  The sign’s concept is one of a diorama, with 
several layers creating depth and creating shadows that change throughout the day. 

 In the forefront, the wavy blue band across the bottom pays homage to our roots as a river 
city. 



 The addition of the red and white stripes acknowledges our city’s home to the creator of 
Flag Day. 

 The “middle” layer depicts a stylized skyline featuring several of our iconic buildings, 
stating that we are (from left to right): 

 A city whose horizons are blessed with striking churches (Congregational and 
Methodists churches are shown) 

 A social city, rich in civic pride and volunteerism (the band shell) 
 A city that embraces our riverfront (the gazebo) 
 A city with distinctive homes (Frank Lloyd Wright’s Gridley House) 
 A city of industry (the Campana Building) 
 A city of science and technology (the Fermi lab tower) 

 
 The radiating bands in the background subtly tell the story of our transition from 
a city of windmills and wind power to a city of nuclear energy. 

 There is no reason our signs cannot tell a slightly different story at each location.  The 
images y o u  see have different messages.  Taken as a whole they reveal the many facets of 
our story.  For example, others can say “The City of Energy” and “Always Moving, by 
Nature”. 

CONSTRUCTION 

The construction of the sign is not complex.  Each layer is made of laser‐cut, non‐rusting 
aluminum sheets, with a long‐lasting anodized paint finish.  The layers are offset only by 
2” or 3” inches apiece, enough to create shadow lines.  The options shown include either 
a tube aluminum supporting frame or a poured concrete with a stone slip‐form similar to 
that used elsewhere in the city. 

I would like to see a single LED lighting strip behind the skyline layer, powered by a small 
solar panel, therefore not requiring any electrical wiring.  The LED strip would both 
illuminate the BATAVIA lettering, and enhance the relief image of the skyline.  LED 
requires virtually no maintenance and will last for decades. 

The only maintenance the sign will require is an occasional hosing with water. 
 

Submittal 5: 
 

Attached are two puffs - one for the monument "Welcome to Batavia" Sign and the second is 
for the directional to downtown.  You will see quickly that I tied the two together 
  
Key items to notice: 
 
1. I added a river to the logo to balance and give energy - I think it really completes it. 
2. Should consider using a single logo to promote the city - if not mine, totally cool, but there 



    Needs to be a consistent branded image put forth 
3. Elements I included in the actual signs are a Prairie Style feel - a la Frank Lloyd Wright, 
    who obviously has a house here in Batavia.  Also incorporates Limestone - to celebrate   
     the industry that was once vibrant here in Batavia and what we literally built the town    
    (and Chicago) upon. 
4. The directional has to variants, depending on location on that corner and how prominent it 
    will be seen 
5. Assuming the sign will be backlit. 

 
I thought I’d get this to you asap. We may get you some comments before Tuesday.  
 
This matter will be on the February 23, 2016 agenda for discussion.  We would appreciate your 
thoughts and insights.   
 
Thank you  
 
Attachment: PowerPoint 
 
C: Department Heads  
 



1a 



1b 

 
 
 



2 



3 



4a 



4b 



4c 



5a 



5b 


	2015 IPMC Memo-- Final
	CITY OF BATAVIA

	Ordinance 16-13 International Property Maintenance Code Draft
	2015 IPMC Amendments--Final Draft
	16-02-15 Boundary Signage
	CITY OF BATAVIA
	DATE:            February 15, 2016
	TO:                 Mayor & City Council

	OVERVIEW
	THE SIGN
	CONSTRUCTION

	16-02-15 Powerpoint
	Slide Number 1
	Slide Number 2
	Slide Number 3
	Slide Number 4
	Slide Number 5
	Slide Number 6
	Slide Number 7
	Slide Number 8
	Slide Number 9




